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Personal Evangelism 
 
REQUIREMENTS TO EVANGELIZE  EVERY SPIRITUAL OPPORTUNITY 
 
Be a Christian (Be Saved) 
“But seek ye first the kingdom of God, 
and his righteousness; and all these 
things shall be added unto you.” (Matt. 
6:33) 
 
Maintain a Burden for the Lost 
“For though I preach the gospel, I have 
nothing to glory of: for necessity is laid 
upon me; yea, woe is unto me, if I 
preach not the gospel!” (1 Cor. 9:16) 
 
Possess a Working Bible Knowledge 
“So shall my word be that goeth forth 
out of my mouth: it shall not return 
unto me void, but it shall accomplish 
that which I please, and it shall prosper 
in the thing whereto I sent it.” (Isa. 
55:11) 
 
Stay in Frequent and Fervent Prayer 
“Confess your faults one to another, 
and pray one for another, that ye may 
be healed. The effectual fervent prayer 
of a righteous man availeth much.” 
(James 5:16) 
 
Be Holy Spirit Filled and Directed 
“And be not drunk with wine, wherein 
is excess; but be filled with the Spirit;” 
(Eph. 5:16) 
 

 
Rejection of the “Man-Fearing” Spirit 
“And fear not them which kill the 
body, but are not able to kill the soul: 
but rather fear him which is able to 
destroy both soul and body in hell.” 
(Matt. 10:26) 
 
 
 
Scripture (Verbally or with a Tract) 
“So shall my word be that goeth forth 
out of my mouth: it shall not return 
unto me void, but it shall accomplish 
that which I please, and it shall prosper 
in the thing whereto I sent it.” (Isa. 
55:11) 
 
 
 
Testimony (Your First-Hand Witness) 
“Men, brethren, and fathers, hear ye 
my defense which I make now unto 
you.” (Acts 22:1) 
 
 
 
Invitation (Bible Study or Salvation)  
“King Agrippa, believest thou the 
prophets? I know that thou believest.” 
(Acts 26:27) 
 

 


